
 

Email: (Clerk-Treasurer) advancect@townofadvance.com (Deputy Clerk) ckellog@townofadvance.com 

Tags: 
Golf Cart Tags—$30.00 
 
Pet Tags**—$5.00/each, 
maximum charge—$15.00 
per household 
**Each year we need to make 
sure we have an up to date 
shot record and photo on file 
for each pet.  

 

Opening for Business: 

Jawbone BBQ, at 103 W Wall 
is currently scheduled to 
open June 15th.  If you have 
not already heard, it is a 
butcher shop/deli that Mar-
shal Brad Thomas is open-
ing. Everyone should stop in 
and check it out!! 

 

“Life is not always a matter of 
holding good cards, but some-
times, playing a poor hand well 
“ 

―Jack London 

Town Council Meetings: 

Location:  

Advance Fire Station  

Time: 7:00 pm 

 June 18th (originally 
June 10th) 

 July 8th 

 August 12th 

 September  17th 

If you are unable to attend 
the Town Council Meetings, 
all meeting minutes can be 
found online at  

www.townofadvance.com 

If additional meetings are 
scheduled, notices will be 
posted in the Post Office, the 
Clerk-Treasurer’s Office, the 
fire station, as well as on the 
website and in the Lebanon 

Reporter.  

 
 

New After Hours Utility 
Emergency Phone Proce-
dure:  
We will no longer be using a 
separate phone for after 
hours utility emergencies. 
Simply call the office phone 
number (765-676-6611)after 
hours and you will be auto-
matically  redirected to a 
Town Representative. Please 
do not call this number for 
billing questions or con-

cerns. The Representative 
you are directed to will not 
have access to your account 
or billing information. 
 
St Rd 75 Project: 
This is a State project, not a 
Town project. Any and all 
issues relating to the con-
struction project should be 
addressed directly with IN-
DOT. You can visit them at  
www.indot4u.com to report 

a concern, request informa-
tion and/or assistance, or 
search through FAQs. You 
can also call 855INDOT4U 
(855-463-6848) 
 
 

2020 US Census: 
The 2020 Census is fast ap-
proaching. There will be 
four ways to complete the 
survey: US Mail; call-in; 
online via smart-phone, 
tablet or computer; or a Rep 
going door to door. 
 
The US Census Bureau will 
be hiring both full and part-
time local help for the up-
coming Census. Applicants 
must be a US Citizen and at 
least 18 years of age. The 
pay will be $14/hr. Inter-
ested parties should apply 
online at: 
www.2020census.gov/jobs 
Fliers regarding this can be 
picked up at the Town Hall.  
 
The Town has no part in, or 
influence with, the hiring 
process for these positions. 
All hiring will be directly 
thru the Census Bureau. 
 

Town Business 

Clerk-Treasurer’s Desk 

 

  
  
  

  

Town of Advance 

P O Box 67 

112 N. Main Street 

Advance, IN 46102 

www.townofadvance.com 

 

Phone: 765-676-6611 

Fax:  765-676-6696 

 

This institution is an equal opportunity 

provider and employer. 
 

Dates to Remember: 

 June 15th: Jawbone BBQ open-

ing day! 

 June 16th - Father’s Day! 

 July 4th - Office Closed for 4th 

of July! 
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